
Page 1  of   2  

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

Compressed Gas Storage Area 

Date:   
 
 
 
 

Compressed Gas Cylinders 
 

Y N   N/A  
 
1. Are all valve protectors always placed on cylinders when 
the cylinders are not in use or connected for use? 
 

 
2. Are compressed gas cylinders stored in areas which are 
protected from external heat sources such as flame 
impingement, intense radiant heat, electric arcs, or high 
temperature lines? 
 

 
3. Are cylinders legibly marked to clearly identify the gas 
contained? 
 

 
4. Are cylinders located or stored in a manner to prevent 
them from creating a hazard by tipping, falling, or rolling? 
 

 
5. Are cylinders located or stored in areas where they will 
not be damaged by passing or falling objects or subjects to 
tampering by unauthorized persons? 
 

 
6. Are cylinders with a water weight capacity over 30 
pounds equipped with means for connecting a valve 
protector device, or with a collar or recess to protect the 
valve? 
 

 
7. Are low pressure fuel-gas cylinders checked periodically 
for corrosion, general distortion, cracks, or any other defect 
that might indicate a weakness or render it unfit for 
service? 
 

 
8. Are valves closed off before a cylinder is moved, when 
the cylinder is empty, and at the completion of each job? 
 

 
9. Does the periodic check of low pressure fuel-gas 
cylinders include a close inspection of the cylinders' 
bottom? 

 
Compressed Gas: Explosion Control 

 

Y N   N/A 
 

                 11. Are liquified gases stored and shipped valve-end 
up with valve covers in place? 

 
                 12. Are pressure-reducing regulators used only for the 

gas and pressures for which they are intended? 

 
                 13. Before a regulator is removed, is the valve closed 

and gas released from the regulator? 

 
Fire Alarm Systems 
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Y N   N/A 
 

 
14. If you have a non-supervised fire alarm system, is it 
tested bimonthly? 
 

 
15. If you have a supervised employee alarm system (that 
is, does the alarm have a device that indicates system 
malfunction), is it tested yearly? 

 
Liquified Petroleum Gas 

 

Y N   N/A 
 

                 16. Are "No Smoking" signs posted on liquified 
petroleum gas tanks? 

 
                 17. Are liquified petroleum storage tanks guarded 

to prevent damage from vehicles? 

 
                 18. Is liquified petroleum gas stored, handled, and used 

in accordance with safe practices and standards? 

 
Portable Fire Extinguishers 

 

Y N   N/A 
 

                 19. Are all fire extinguishers inspected and 
recharged regularly, and noted on the inspection tag? 

 
                 20. Are appropriate fire extinguishers mounted, 

located, and identified so that they are readily 
accessible to employees? 

 
                 21. Are portable fire extinguishers provided in 

adequate number and type? 


